
PRAYER OF CONFESSION

Heavenly Father, I thank You that I have been bought and paid for by the blood of Jesus Christ, and 
because I have been bought and paid for, I am an heir of God and a joint-heir with Jesus. As a joint-
heir, I live in Jesus and He lives in me. I have the right to overcome because He overcame.
Now as an overcomer, I break every evil word, curse, and spell that has ever been spoken over me.
I take those words and nail them to the cross and appropriate the power of the cross in breaking 
every word spoken against me. I thank You that because of the exchange that took place at the 
cross, I can receive mercy. I cancel every curse that has come or would try to come upon me 
through the sins of my forefathers to the 3rd and 4th generations past. I take those curses and nail 
them to the cross and appropriate the power of the cross in breaking every curse. Your word says 
that Jesus was made a curse for me; as a matter of fact, I place the cross of Jesus between me and 
the curses that try to come upon me so that when they come to me, they have to come through the 
blood of the cross and the blood of the cross will transform them from a curse to a blessing. With an 
act of my will I choose to receive every blessing that You, Heavenly Father, have for me. Now I take 
back any ground that I have ever given to any demonic spirit, whether I did it knowingly or 
unknowingly. I renounce all contact with anything occultic or satanic. No evil spirits have any right to 
me. I cancel their lease on my life and serve them their eviction notice. I declare them defeated in 
every area of my life. Now I specifically take authority over the spirit of infirmity, fear, whoredom/
idolatry, perverseness, deaf and dumb, lying, error, divination, bondage, haughtiness, antichrist, 
heaviness, jealousy, and slumber/sleep. I cut your chains and break your bands, in the name of 
Jesus Christ, I bind you and cast you out now. You have no place or memorial in me.
You are defeated and cast down. I pull down every stronghold by the mighty Name and authority of 
Jesus Christ, by His resurrection power and by the power of the cross. Satan, you and all your 
demons are defeated and your power broken this day in my life. The old me died with Christ on the 
cross; therefore, everything from the kingdom of darkness has lost its hold on me for I am a new 
creation in Christ Jesus.


